
James
Is your faith visible?

James 1:22 Be doers of the word, and not hearers only. Otherwise, you are deceiving yourselves.

A Study of the 
book of 



2 Corinthians 13

5 Examine yourselves to see whether you are in 
the faith; test yourselves. Do you not realize that 
Christ Jesus is in you—unless, of course, you fail 
the test?



James 2

14 What use is it, my brethren, if someone says he 
has faith but he has no works? Can that faith save 
him? 15 If a brother or sister is without clothing 
and in need of daily food, 16 and one of you says 
to them, “Go in peace, be warmed and be filled,” 
and yet you do not give them what is necessary for 
their body, what use is that? 17 Even so faith, if it 
has no works, is dead, being by itself.



James 2

18 But someone may well say, “You have faith and 
I have works; show me your faith without the 
works, and I will show you my faith by my works.” 
19 You believe that God is one. You do well; the 
demons also believe, and shudder. 



James 2

20 Do you want to be shown, you foolish person, 
that faith apart from works is useless?

What the inner man believes 
The outer man does



James 2

21 Was not Abraham our father justified by works 
when he offered up his son Isaac on the altar? 22 
You see that faith was active along with his works, 
and faith was completed by his works; 23 and the 
Scripture was fulfilled that says, “Abraham 
believed God, and it was counted to him as 
righteousness”—and he was called a friend of 
God. 24 You see that a person is justified by works 
and not by faith alone. 



Genesis 22

12 “Do not lay a hand on the boy,” he said. “Do 
not do anything to him. Now I know that you fear 
God, because you have not withheld from me your 
son, your only son.”



James 2

21 Was not Abraham our father justified by works 
when he offered up his son Isaac on the altar? 22 
You see that faith was active along with his works, 
and faith was completed by his works; 23 and the 
Scripture was fulfilled that says, “Abraham 
believed God, and it was counted to him as 
righteousness”—and he was called a friend of 
God. 24 You see that a person is justified by works 
and not by faith alone. 



James 2

25 And in the same way was not also Rahab the 
prostitute justified by works when she received the 
messengers and sent them out by another way? 26 
For as the body apart from the spirit is dead, so 
also faith apart from works is dead.



James 2

21 Was not Abraham our father justified by works
when he offered up his son Isaac on the altar? 22 
You see that faith was active along with his works, 
and faith was completed by his works; 23 and the 
Scripture was fulfilled that says, “Abraham 
believed God, and it was counted to him as 
righteousness”—and he was called a friend of 
God. 24 You see that a person is justified by works
and not by faith alone. 



Galatians 2

15 “We who are Jews by birth and not sinful 
Gentiles 16 know that a person is not justified by 
the works of the law, but by faith in Jesus Christ. 
So we, too, have put our faith in Christ Jesus that 
we may be justified by faith in Christ and not by 
the works of the law, because by the works of the 
law no one will be justified.



Romans 4

2 If, in fact, Abraham was justified by works, he 
had something to boast about—but not before 
God. 3 What does Scripture say? “Abraham 
believed God, and it was credited to him as 
righteousness.”

4 Now to the one who works, wages are not 
credited as a gift but as an obligation.         5 
However, to the one who does not work but trusts 
God who justifies the ungodly, their faith is 
credited as righteousness.



Romans 4

2 If, in fact, Abraham was justified by works, he 
had something to boast about—but not before 
God. 3 What does Scripture say? “Abraham 
believed God, and it was credited to him as 
righteousness.”

4 Now to the one who works, wages are not 
credited as a gift but as an obligation.         5 
However, to the one who does not work but trusts 
God who justifies the ungodly, their faith is 
credited as righteousness.



Ephesians 1

13 And you also were included in Christ when you 
heard the message of truth, the gospel of your 
salvation. When you believed, you were marked in 
him with a seal, the promised Holy Spirit, 14 who 
is a deposit guaranteeing our inheritance until the 
redemption of those who are God’s possession—
to the praise of his glory.



James 2

21 Was not Abraham our father justified by works 
when he offered up his son Isaac on the altar? 22 
You see that faith was active along with his works, 
and faith was completed by his works; 23 and the 
Scripture was fulfilled that says, “Abraham 
believed God, and it was counted to him as 
righteousness”—and he was called a friend of 
God. 24 You see that a person is justified by works 
and not by faith alone. 



James 2

23 and the Scripture was fulfilled that says, 
“Abraham believed         and it was counted to him 
as righteousness”—and he was called a friend of 
God.

True faith necessarily means you have a 
new King

God,   



Joshua 2

11 When we heard of it, our hearts melted in fear 
and everyone’s courage failed because of you, for 
the Lord your God is God in heaven above and on 
the earth below.

True faith necessarily means you have a 
new King



John 15

13 Greater love has no one than this: to lay down 
one’s life for one’s friends.       14 You are my 
friends if you do what I command.

The outer man obeys who the inner 
man is submitted to



Hebrews 10

19 Therefore, brothers and sisters, since we have 
confidence to enter the Most Holy Place by the 
blood of Jesus, 20 by a new and living way opened 
for us through the curtain, that is, his body, 21 and 
since we have a great priest over the house of God, 
22 let us draw near to God with a sincere heart and 
with the full assurance that faith brings, having our 
hearts sprinkled to cleanse us from a guilty 
conscience and having our bodies washed with 
pure water.



Hebrews 10

23 Let us hold unswervingly to the hope we 
profess, for he who promised is faithful. 24 And let 
us consider how we may spur one another on 
toward love and good deeds, 25 not giving up 
meeting together, as some are in the habit of 
doing, but encouraging one another—and all the 
more as you see the Day approaching.
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